

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
 P. O. BOX 2449
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for
 FOR: Well Maintenance Services
 TIME & (July 1, 2015 through June 30, 2016)
 DATE: 3:00 p.m., May 28, 2015

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY	UNIT	Peerless Equipment, Ltd. 5400-1 New Hwy 90 West San Antonio, TX 78227	Alstey, Inc. 3359 SE Loop 410 San Antonio, TX 78222	Advanced Water Well Technologies	Layne Christenson Co.
Group A FIRST YEAR BASE PERIOD						
Pump Pulling and Installation						
	6,000 ft.	UNIT				
1.	Pull or Install (per foot of column) - Small Pumps (2" - 6")	PRICE	10.00	25.00		
		TOTAL	60,000.00	150,000.00		
	8,000 ft.	UNIT				
2.	Pull or Install (per foot of column) - Medium Pumps (8" - 14")	PRICE	30.00	40.00		
		TOTAL	240,000.00	320,000.00		
	1,000 ft.	UNIT				
3.	Pull or Install (per foot of column) - Large Pumps (>16")	PRICE	50.00	75.00		
		TOTAL	50,000.00	75,000.00		
	150,000 per year	UNIT	10%	50%		
4.	Well Mudding Services	PRICE	150,000.00	150,000.00		
		TOTAL	165,000.00	225,000.00		
	40 hrs.	UNIT				
5.	Well Bailing	PRICE	150.00	200.00		
		TOTAL	6,000.00	8,000.00		
	1,200 ft.	UNIT				
6.	Well Video Log	PRICE	4.00	1.50		
		TOTAL	4,800.00	1,800.00		
	1,200 ft.	UNIT				
7.	Well Geophysical Survey	PRICE	4.00	2.50		
		TOTAL	4,800.00	3,000.00		
	1,000 ft.	UNIT				
8.	Dekoron Airline Installation	PRICE	3.50	2.00		
		TOTAL	3,500.00	2,000.00		
	\$80,000 / year	UNIT	10%	20%		
9.	Miscellaneous Parts	PRICE	80,000.00	80,000.00		
		TOTAL	88,000.00	96,000.00		
	120 hrs.	UNIT				
10.	Fishing for Pump, Column, or Parts	PRICE	200.00	400.00		
		TOTAL	24,000.00	48,000.00		
	240 hrs.	UNIT				
11.	Scratching and Cleaning	PRICE	200.00	300.00		
		TOTAL	48,000.00	72,000.00		
	200 hrs.	UNIT				
12.	Blockage Removal	PRICE	200.00	1,000.00		
		TOTAL	40,000.00	200,000.00		
	SUBTOTAL (GROUP A)	TOTAL	734,100.00	1,200,800.00		
Group B Well Pump Repair						
	20 ea.	UNIT				
1.	Pump Teardown and Inspection (all sizes)	PRICE	500.00	1,000.00		
		TOTAL	10,000.00	20,000.00		
	250 hrs.	UNIT				
2.	Pump Repair Shop Labor - Regular Time	PRICE	100.00	100.00		
		TOTAL	25,000.00	25,000.00		
	20 hrs.	UNIT				
3.	Pump Repair Shop Labor - Overtime	PRICE	100.00	200.00		
		TOTAL	2,000.00	4,000.00		
	\$100,000 / year	UNIT	20%	40%		
4.	Pump Parts and Materials	PRICE	100,000.00	100,000.00		
		TOTAL	120,000.00	140,000.00		
	\$40,000 / year	UNIT	20%	40%		
5.	Line Shaft Replacement	PRICE	40,000.00	40,000.00		
		TOTAL	48,000.00	56,000.00		
	\$40,000 / year	UNIT	20%	35%		
6.	Line Shaft Bearings	PRICE	40,000.00	40,000.00		
		TOTAL	48,000.00	54,000.00		

NO BID

NO BID

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
 P. O. BOX 2449
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for
 FOR: Well Maintenance Services
 TIME & (July 1, 2015 through June 30, 2016)
 DATE: 3:00 p.m., May 28, 2015
 ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

Peerless Equipment, Ltd.
 5400-1 New Hwy 90 West
 San Antonio, TX 78227

Alstey, Inc.
 3359 SE Loop 410
 San Antonio, TX 78222

Advanced Water Well
 Technologies

Layne Christenson Co.

7.	5,000 SF Column Pipe and/or Pump Coating	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	12.00 60,000.00	17.50 87,500.00
8.	\$50,000 / year Bid Mark-ups	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	10% 50,000.00 55,000.00	30% 50,000.00 65,000.00
	SUBTOTAL (GROUP B)	TOTAL	368,000.00	451,500.00
Group C	Submersible Pump and Motor Repair	UNIT PRICE TOTAL		
1.	2 ea. Motor Teardown & Inspection - 8" Diameter Frame	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	100.00 200.00	300.00 600.00
2.	2 ea. Motor Teardown and Inspection - 10" - 12" Diameter Frame	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	100.00 200.00	700.00 1,400.00
3.	2 ea. Motor Teardown and Inspection - 14" - 16" Diameter Frame	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	250.00 500.00	700.00 1,400.00
4.	1 ea. Motor Teardown and Inspection - 18" Diameter Frame	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	500.00 500.00	900.00 900.00
5.	150 hrs. Repair Shop Labor - Regular Time	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	125.00 18,750.00	85.00 12,750.00
6.	20 hrs. Repair Shop Labor - Overtime	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	125.00 2,500.00	97.75 1,955.00
7.	2 ea. Pump and Submersible Motor Unit Test	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	2,500.00 5,000.00	5,000.00 10,000.00
8.	\$100,000 / year Motor Parts and Materials	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	10% 100,000.00 110,000.00	30% 100,000.00 130,000.00
9.	10 trips Shipping Costs (Round Trip)	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	2,000.00 20,000.00	5,000.00 50,000.00
	SUBTOTAL (GROUP C)	TOTAL	157,650.00	209,005.00
Group D	Well Pump and Component Replacement	UNIT PRICE TOTAL		
	\$200,000 / year Well Pumps	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	20% 200,000.00 240,000.00	35% 200,000.00 270,000.00
	\$200,000 / year Well Motors	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	15% 200,000.00 230,000.00	30% 200,000.00 260,000.00
	\$60,000 / year Column Pipe, Discharge Head, and other Components	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	20% 60,000.00 72,000.00	40% 60,000.00 84,000.00
	\$50,000 / year Power Cable	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	15% 50,000.00 57,500.00	30% 50,000.00 65,000.00
	SUBTOTAL (GROUP D)	TOTAL	599,500.00	679,000.00
		TOTAL	*	
	FIRST YEAR BASE PERIOD TOTAL CONTRACT AMOUNT (Groups A, B, C AND D)	TOTAL	1,859,250.00	2,540,305.00

NO BID

NO BID

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
 P. O. BOX 2449
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL: Annual Contract for
 FOR: Well Maintenance Services
 TIME & DATE: (July 1, 2015 through June 30, 2016)
 3:00 p.m., May 28, 2015
 ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

Peerless Equipment, Ltd. 5400-1 New Hwy 90 West San Antonio, TX 78227	Alstey, Inc. 3359 SE Loop 410 San Antonio, TX 78222	Advanced Water Well Technologies	Layne Christenson Co.
---	---	-------------------------------------	-----------------------

Group A	OPTION YEAR 1 Pump Pulling and Installation	UNIT				
1.	6,000 ft. Pull or Install (per foot of column) - Small Pumps (2" - 6")	PRICE	14.00	25.00		
		TOTAL	84,000.00	150,000.00		
2.	8,000 ft. Pull or Install (per foot of column) - Medium Pumps (8" - 14")	PRICE	35.00	40.00		
		TOTAL	280,000.00	320,000.00		
3.	1,000 ft. Pull or Install (per foot of column) - Large Pumps (>16")	PRICE	60.00	75.00		
		TOTAL	60,000.00	75,000.00		
4.	\$150,000 per year Well Mudding Services	PRICE	150,000.00	150,000.00		
		TOTAL	172,500.00	225,000.00		
5.	40 hrs. Well Bailing	PRICE	150.00	200.00		
		TOTAL	6,000.00	8,000.00		
6.	1,200 ft. Well Video Log	PRICE	4.00	1.50		
		TOTAL	4,800.00	1,800.00		
7.	1,200 ft. Well Geophysical Survey	PRICE	4.00	2.50		
		TOTAL	4,800.00	3,000.00		
8.	1,000 ft. Dekoron Airline Installation	PRICE	3.50	2.00		
		TOTAL	3,500.00	2,000.00		
9.	\$80,000 / year Miscellaneous Parts	PRICE	80,000.00	80,000.00		
		TOTAL	88,000.00	96,000.00		
10.	120 hrs. Fishing for Pump, Column, or Parts	PRICE	200.00	400.00		
		TOTAL	24,000.00	48,000.00		
11.	240 hrs. Scratching and Cleaning	PRICE	200.00	300.00		
		TOTAL	48,000.00	72,000.00		
12.	200 hrs. Blockage Removal	PRICE	200.00	1,000.00		
		TOTAL	40,000.00	200,000.00		
	SUBTOTAL (GROUP A)	TOTAL	815,600.00	1,200,800.00		
Group B	Well Pump Repair	UNIT				
1.	20 ea. Pump Teardown and Inspection (all sizes)	PRICE	500.00	1,000.00		
		TOTAL	10,000.00	20,000.00		
2.	250 hrs. Pump Repair Shop Labor - Regular Time	PRICE	100.00	100.00		
		TOTAL	25,000.00	25,000.00		
3.	20 hrs. Pump Repair Shop Labor - Overtime	PRICE	100.00	200.00		
		TOTAL	2,000.00	4,000.00		
4.	\$100,000 / year Pump Parts and Materials	PRICE	100,000.00	100,000.00		
		TOTAL	120,000.00	140,000.00		
5.	\$40,000 / year Line Shaft Replacement	PRICE	40,000.00	40,000.00		
		TOTAL	48,000.00	56,000.00		
6.	\$40,000 / year Line Shaft Bearings	PRICE	40,000.00	40,000.00		
		TOTAL	48,000.00	54,000.00		

NO BID

NO BID

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
 P. O. BOX 2449
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for
 FOR: Well Maintenance Services
 TIME & (July 1, 2015 through June 30, 2016)
 DATE: 3:00 p.m., May 28, 2015
 ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

Peerless Equipment, Ltd.
 5400-1 New Hwy 90 West
 San Antonio, TX 78227

Alstey, Inc.
 3359 SE Loop 410
 San Antonio, TX 78222

Advanced Water Well
 Technologies

Layne Christenson Co.

7.	5,000 SF Column Pipe and/or Pump Coating	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	12.00 60,000.00	17.50 87,500.00
8.	\$50,000 / year Bid Mark-ups	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	10% 50,000.00 55,000.00	30% 50,000.00 65,000.00
Subtotal (Group B)		TOTAL	368,000.00	451,500.00
Group C Submersible Pump and Motor Repair		UNIT PRICE TOTAL		
1.	2 ea. Motor Teardown & Inspection - 8" Diameter Frame	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	100.00 200.00	300.00 600.00
2.	2 ea. Motor Teardown and Inspection - 10" - 12" Diameter Frame	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	100.00 200.00	700.00 1,400.00
3.	2 ea. Motor Teardown and Inspection - 14" - 16" Diameter Frame	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	250.00 500.00	700.00 1,400.00
4.	1 ea. Motor Teardown and Inspection - 18" Diameter Frame	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	500.00 500.00	900.00 900.00
5.	150 hrs. Repair Shop Labor - Regular Time	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	125.00 18,750.00	85.00 12,750.00
6.	20 hrs. Repair Shop Labor - Overtime	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	125.00 2,500.00	97.75 1,955.00
7.	2 ea. Pump and Submersible Motor Unit Test	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	2,500.00 5,000.00	5,000.00 10,000.00
8.	\$100,000 / year Motor Parts and Materials	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	10% 100,000.00 110,000.00	30% 100,000.00 130,000.00
9.	10 trips Shipping Costs (Round Trip)	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	2,000.00 20,000.00	5,000.00 50,000.00
Subtotal (Group C)		TOTAL	157,650.00	209,005.00
Group D Well Pump and Component Replacement		UNIT PRICE TOTAL		
	\$200,000 / year Well Pumps	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	20% 200,000.00 240,000.00	35% 200,000.00 270,000.00
	\$200,000 / year Well Motors	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	15% 200,000.00 230,000.00	30% 200,000.00 260,000.00
	\$60,000 / year Column Pipe, Discharge Head, and other Components	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	20% 60,000.00 72,000.00	40% 60,000.00 84,000.00
	\$50,000 / year Power Cable	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	15% 50,000.00 57,500.00	30% 50,000.00 65,000.00
Subtotal (Group D)		TOTAL	599,500.00	679,000.00

NO BID

NO BID

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
 P. O. BOX 2449
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for
 FOR: Well Maintenance Services
 TIME & (July 1, 2015 through June 30, 2016)
 DATE: 3:00 p.m., May 28, 2015
 ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

Peerless Equipment, Ltd.
 5400-1 New Hwy 90 West
 San Antonio, TX 78227

Alstey, Inc.
 3359 SE Loop 410
 San Antonio, TX 78222

Advanced Water Well
 Technologies

Layne Christenson Co.

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY		Peerless Equipment, Ltd. 5400-1 New Hwy 90 West San Antonio, TX 78227	Alstey, Inc. 3359 SE Loop 410 San Antonio, TX 78222	Advanced Water Well Technologies	Layne Christenson Co.
	OPTION YEAR 1 TOTAL CONTR+B48ACT AMOUNT (Groups A, B, C AND D)	TOTAL	1,940,750.00	2,540,305.00		
	OPTION YEAR 2					
Group A	Pump Pulling and Installation	UNIT				
	6,000 ft.	PRICE	14.00	30.00		
1.	Pull or Install (per foot of column) - Small Pumps (2" - 6")	TOTAL	84,000.00	180,000.00		
	8,000 ft.	UNIT				
		PRICE	35.00	45.00		
2.	Pull or Install (per foot of column) - Medium Pumps (8" - 14")	TOTAL	280,000.00	360,000.00		
	1,000 ft.	UNIT				
		PRICE	60.00	80.00		
3.	Pull or Install (per foot of column) - Large Pumps (>16")	TOTAL	60,000.00	80,000.00		
	\$150,000 per year	UNIT	15%	50%		
	Well Mudding Services	PRICE	150,000.00	150,000.00		
4.		TOTAL	172,500.00	225,000.00		
	40 hrs.	UNIT				
	Well Bailing	PRICE	150.00	225.00		
5.		TOTAL	6,000.00	9,000.00		
	1,200 ft.	UNIT				
	Well Video Log	PRICE	4.00	1.75		
6.		TOTAL	4,800.00	2,100.00		
	1,200 ft.	UNIT				
	Well Geophysical Survey	PRICE	4.00	2.75		
7.		TOTAL	4,800.00	3,300.00		
	1,000 ft.	UNIT				
	Dekoron Airline Installation	PRICE	3.50	2.25		
8		TOTAL	3,500.00	2,250.00		
	\$80,000 / year	UNIT	10%	25%		
	Miscellaneous Parts	PRICE	80,000.00	80,000.00		
9.		TOTAL	88,000.00	100,000.00		
	120 hrs.	UNIT				
	Fishing for Pump, Column, or Parts	PRICE	200.00	425.00		
10.		TOTAL	24,000.00	51,000.00		
	240 hrs.	UNIT				
	Scratching and Cleaning	PRICE	200.00	325.00		
11.		TOTAL	48,000.00	78,000.00		
	200 hrs.	UNIT				
	Blockage Removal	PRICE	200.00	1,200.00		
12.		TOTAL	40,000.00	240,000.00		
	SUBTOTAL (GROUP A)	TOTAL	815,600.00	1,330,650.00		
Group B	Well Pump Repair	UNIT				
	20 ea.	PRICE	500.00	1,000.00		
1.	Pump Teardown and Inspection (all sizes)	TOTAL	10,000.00	20,000.00		
	250 hrs.	UNIT				
	Pump Repair Shop Labor - Regular Time	PRICE	100.00	100.00		
2.		TOTAL	25,000.00	25,000.00		
	20 hrs.	UNIT				
	Pump Repair Shop Labor - Overtime	PRICE	100.00	200.00		
3.		TOTAL	2,000.00	4,000.00		
	\$100,000 / year	UNIT	20%	45%		
	Pump Parts and Materials	PRICE	100,000.00	100,000.00		
4.		TOTAL	120,000.00	145,000.00		
	\$40,000 / year	UNIT	20%	45%		
	Line Shaft Replacement	PRICE	40,000.00	40,000.00		
5.		TOTAL	48,000.00	58,000.00		

NO BID

NO BID

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
 P. O. BOX 2449
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for
 FOR: Well Maintenance Services
 TIME & (July 1, 2015 through June 30, 2016)
 DATE: 3:00 p.m., May 28, 2015
 ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

Peerless Equipment, Ltd.
 5400-1 New Hwy 90 West
 San Antonio, TX 78227

Alstey, Inc.
 3359 SE Loop 410
 San Antonio, TX 78222

Advanced Water Well
 Technologies

Layne Christenson Co.

6.	\$40,000 / year Line Shaft Bearings	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	20% 40,000.00 48,000.00	40% 40,000.00 56,000.00
7.	5,000 SF Column Pipe and/or Pump Coating	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	14.00 70,000.00	20.00 100,000.00
8.	\$50,000 / year Bid Mark-ups	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	20% 50,000.00 60,000.00	35% 50,000.00 67,500.00
	SUBTOTAL (GROUP B)	TOTAL	383,000.00	475,500.00
Group C	Submersible Pump and Motor Repair			
1.	2 ea. Motor Teardown & Inspection - 8" Diameter Frame	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	100.00 200.00	350.00 700.00
2.	2 ea. Motor Teardown and Inspection - 10" - 12" Diameter Frame	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	100.00 200.00	750.00 1,500.00
3.	2 ea. Motor Teardown and Inspection - 14" - 16" Diameter Frame	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	250.00 500.00	750.00 1,500.00
4.	1 ea. Motor Teardown and Inspection - 18" Diameter Frame	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	500.00 500.00	950.00 950.00
5.	150 hrs. Repair Shop Labor - Regular Time	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	125.00 18,750.00	85.00 12,750.00
6.	20 hrs. Repair Shop Labor - Overtime	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	125.00 2,500.00	97.75 1,955.00
7.	2 ea. Pump and Submersible Motor Unit Test	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	2,500.00 5,000.00	5,000.00 10,000.00
8.	\$100,000 / year Motor Parts and Materials	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	10% 100,000.00 110,000.00	35% 100,000.00 135,000.00
9.	10 trips Shipping Costs (Round Trip)	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	2,000.00 20,000.00	5,000.00 50,000.00
	SUBTOTAL (GROUP C)	TOTAL	157,650.00	214,355.00
Group D	Well Pump and Component Replacement			
	\$200,000 / year Well Pumps	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	20% 200,000.00 240,000.00	40% 200,000.00 280,000.00
	\$200,000 / year Well Motors	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	15% 200,000.00 230,000.00	35% 200,000.00 270,000.00
	\$60,000 / year Column Pipe, Discharge Head, and other Components	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	20% 60,000.00 72,000.00	45% 60,000.00 87,000.00
	\$50,000 / year Power Cable	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	15% 50,000.00 57,500.00	35% 50,000.00 67,500.00
	SUBTOTAL (GROUP D)	TOTAL	599,500.00	704,500.00

NO BID

NO BID

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
 P. O. BOX 2449
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for
 FOR: Well Maintenance Services
 TIME & (July 1, 2015 through June 30, 2016)
 DATE: 3:00 p.m., May 28, 2015
 ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

Peerless Equipment, Ltd.
 5400-1 New Hwy 90 West
 San Antonio, TX 78227

Alstey, Inc.
 3359 SE Loop 410
 San Antonio, TX 78222

Advanced Water Well
 Technologies

Layne Christenson Co.

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY		Peerless Equipment, Ltd. 5400-1 New Hwy 90 West San Antonio, TX 78227	Alstey, Inc. 3359 SE Loop 410 San Antonio, TX 78222	Advanced Water Well Technologies	Layne Christenson Co.
	OPTION YEAR 2 TOTAL CONTRACT AMOUNT (Groups A, B, C AND D)	TOTAL	1,955,750.00	2,725,005.00		
	OPTION YEAR 3					
Group A	Pump Pulling and Installation	UNIT				
	6,000 ft.	PRICE	14.00	30.00		
1.	Pull or Install (per foot of column) - Small Pumps (2" - 6")	TOTAL	84,000.00	180,000.00		
	8,000 ft.	UNIT				
		PRICE	35.00	45.00		
2.	Pull or Install (per foot of column) - Medium Pumps (8" - 14")	TOTAL	280,000.00	360,000.00		
	1,000 ft.	UNIT				
		PRICE	60.00	80.00		
3.	Pull or Install (per foot of column) - Large Pumps (>16")	TOTAL	60,000.00	80,000.00		
	\$150,000 per year	UNIT	15%	50%		
	Well Mudding Services	PRICE	150,000.00	150,000.00		
4.		TOTAL	172,500.00	225,000.00		
	40 hrs.	UNIT				
	Well Bailing	PRICE	150.00	225.00		
5.		TOTAL	6,000.00	9,000.00		
	1,200 ft.	UNIT				
	Well Video Log	PRICE	4.00	1.75		
6.		TOTAL	4,800.00	2,100.00		
	1,200 ft.	UNIT				
	Well Geophysical Survey	PRICE	4.00	2.75		
7.		TOTAL	4,800.00	3,300.00		
	1,000 ft.	UNIT				
	Dekoron Airline Installation	PRICE	3.50	2.25		
8.		TOTAL	3,500.00	2,250.00		
	\$80,000 / year	UNIT	10%	25%		
	Miscellaneous Parts	PRICE	80,000.00	80,000.00		
9.		TOTAL	88,000.00	100,000.00		
	120 hrs.	UNIT				
	Fishing for Pump, Column, or Parts	PRICE	200.00	425.00		
10.		TOTAL	24,000.00	51,000.00		
	240 hrs.	UNIT				
	Scratching and Cleaning	PRICE	200.00	325.00		
11.		TOTAL	48,000.00	78,000.00		
	200 hrs.	UNIT				
	Blockage Removal	PRICE	200.00	1,200.00		
12.		TOTAL	40,000.00	240,000.00		
	SUBTOTAL (GROUP A)	TOTAL	815,600.00	1,330,650.00		
Group B	Well Pump Repair	UNIT				
	20 ea.	PRICE	500.00	1,000.00		
1.	Pump Teardown and Inspection (all sizes)	TOTAL	10,000.00	20,000.00		
	250 hrs.	UNIT				
	Pump Repair Shop Labor - Regular Time	PRICE	100.00	100.00		
2.		TOTAL	25,000.00	25,000.00		
	20 hrs.	UNIT				
	Pump Repair Shop Labor - Overtime	PRICE	100.00	200.00		
3.		TOTAL	2,000.00	4,000.00		
	\$100,000 / year	UNIT	20%	45%		
	Pump Parts and Materials	PRICE	100,000.00	100,000.00		
4.		TOTAL	120,000.00	145,000.00		
	\$40,000 / year	UNIT	20%	45%		
	Line Shaft Replacement	PRICE	40,000.00	40,000.00		
5.		TOTAL	48,000.00	58,000.00		

NO BID

NO BID

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
 P. O. BOX 2449
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for
 FOR: Well Maintenance Services
 TIME & (July 1, 2015 through June 30, 2016)
 DATE: 3:00 p.m., May 28, 2015
 ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

Peerless Equipment, Ltd.
 5400-1 New Hwy 90 West
 San Antonio, TX 78227

Alstey, Inc.
 3359 SE Loop 410
 San Antonio, TX 78222

Advanced Water Well
 Technologies

Layne Christenson Co.

6.	\$40,000 / year Line Shaft Bearings	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	20% 40,000.00 48,000.00	40% 40,000.00 56,000.00
7.	5,000 SF Column Pipe and/or Pump Coating	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	14.00 70,000.00	20.00 100,000.00
8.	\$50,000 / year Bid Mark-ups	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	20% 50,000.00 60,000.00	35% 50,000.00 67,500.00
	SUBTOTAL (GROUP B)	TOTAL	383,000.00	475,500.00
Group C	Submersible Pump and Motor Repair	UNIT		
1.	2 ea. Motor Teardown & Inspection - 8" Diameter Frame	PRICE TOTAL	100.00 200.00	350.00 700.00
2.	2 ea. Motor Teardown and Inspection - 10" - 12" Diameter Frame	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	100.00 200.00	750.00 1,500.00
3.	2 ea. Motor Teardown and Inspection - 14" - 16" Diameter Frame	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	250.00 500.00	750.00 1,500.00
4.	1 ea. Motor Teardown and Inspection - 18" Diameter Frame	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	500.00 500.00	950.00 950.00
5.	150 hrs. Repair Shop Labor - Regular Time	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	125.00 18,750.00	85.00 12,750.00
6.	20 hrs. Repair Shop Labor - Overtime	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	125.00 2,500.00	97.75 1,955.00
7.	2 ea. Pump and Submersible Motor Unit Test	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	2,500.00 5,000.00	5,000.00 10,000.00
8.	\$100,000 / year Motor Parts and Materials	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	10% 100,000.00 110,000.00	35% 100,000.00 135,000.00
9.	10 trips Shipping Costs (Round Trip)	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	2,000.00 20,000.00	5,000.00 50,000.00
	SUBTOTAL (GROUP C)	TOTAL	157,650.00	214,355.00
Group D	Well Pump and Component Replacement	UNIT		
	\$200,000 / year Well Pumps	PRICE TOTAL	20% 200,000.00 240,000.00	40% 200,000.00 280,000.00
	\$200,000 / year Well Motors	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	15% 200,000.00 230,000.00	35% 200,000.00 270,000.00
	\$60,000 / year Column Pipe, Discharge Head, and other Components	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	20% 60,000.00 72,000.00	45% 60,000.00 87,000.00

NO BID

NO BID

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
 P. O. BOX 2449
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for
 FOR: Well Maintenance Services
 TIME & (July 1, 2015 through June 30, 2016)
 DATE: 3:00 p.m., May 28, 2015
 ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY	UNIT	Peerless Equipment, Ltd. 5400-1 New Hwy 90 West San Antonio, TX 78227	Alsay, Inc. 3359 SE Loop 410 San Antonio, TX 78222	Advanced Water Well Technologies	Layne Christenson Co.
	\$50,000 / year Power Cable	PRICE	15% 50,000.00	35% 50,000.00	NO BID	NO BID
		TOTAL	57,500.00	67,500.00		
	SUBTOTAL (GROUP D)	TOTAL	599,500.00	704,500.00		
	OPTION YEAR 3 TOTAL CONTRACT AMOUNT (Groups A, B, C AND D)	TOTAL	1,955,750.00	2,725,005.00		
	Terms		Net 30 days	Net 30 days		
	Delivery Days					

***LOW BIDDER**

BID INVITATIONS E-MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

Alsay, Inc.
 Conhagen
 Davenport Drilling
 DXP
 Layne TX
 Peerless Equipment
 Pump Solutions
 Smith Pump

Demandstar
 SAWS Website